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FAQ's Contact Us Lo

2 e elc ansport & Highways

Apply Online . hways has been facilitating computerization of more than 1000 Road Transport Offices

Upload Documents v RTOS] J] dcid egistration Certificate (RC) & Driving License (DL) that are valid across the country. It was

A int s (Slot & necgs ese documents on a pan-India level to ensure interoperability anq correctness and timely

Booking) availal ttee setup for this purpose had recommended a uniform standardized software across the

FesEaEe count 9 atics Centre the task to standardize & deploy the software VAHAN for Vehicle Registration

and pilation of data with respect to Vehicle Registration and Driving Licenses of all the states

Modify Appications ¥ | instat

Enquiry on Slot Availabilityw ERS
= The VAHAI alized to capture the functionalities as mandated by Central Motor Vehicle Act, 1988 as well as

Gaikel intnents e State motor vehicle Rules with customization in the core product to suit the requirements of 36 States.

Licence Details v

Download Forms v

LLTEST (STALL) v

Other Links. v
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National Informatics Centre
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MINISTRY OF ROAD TRANSPORT & HIGHWAYS Search English B
Government of India

FAQ's Contact Us Lo

Apply Online v

New Learners Licence

een facilitating computerization of more than 1000 Road Transport Offices
priificate (RC) & Driving License (DL) that are valid across the country. It was
its on a pan-India level to ensure interoperability and correctness and timely
this purpose had recommended a uniform standardized software across the
he task to standardize & deploy the software VAHAN for Vehicle Registration

New Driving Licence

Issue Of Learners Licence
For Expired Class Of
Vehicles

es and Of data with respect to Vehicle Registration and Driving Licenses of all the states
Senvices on Leamners Licence in State Register and National Register.
Semices on Driving Licence Click Horo
oo Tictor IotaTcs The VAHAN & SARATHI are conceptualized to capture the functionalities as mandated by Central Motor Vehicle Act, 1988 as well as

= State motor vehicle Rules with customization in the core product to suit the requirements of 36 States.
Sevices on Conductor

Licence

Application Status

Search Related Applications
Find Application Number
Cancel Application

Camp Registration

Dsl Candidate Enroliment
Upload Documents v
m:;‘ens (Slot v
Fee/Payments

Modify Appications v
Enquiry on Slot Availabilityw
Cancel Appointments v
Licence Details v
Download Forms v
LLTEST (STALL) v
Other Links v

Designed, developed and hosted by india.gov.
National Informatics Centre The national portal of india |
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Instructions

State Chhattisgarh Transaction [ ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE

Following are the stages in Application Submission in Is: earner's Licence in t

1. Fill Applicant Details.
2. Upload Decuments

3. Upload Phete and Signature
4, LL Test Slot Booking

5. Payment of Fee

Caralhi s i o et e T S

MINISTRY OF ROAD TRANSPORT & HIGHWAYS SEARCH engish ||
Government of India

Appl for Learner's Licence (LI

Select appropriate choice

If you are a Diplomat / Repatriate / Refugees | Ex-Servi 1 Physically Gt g I
then Please Select

@ | don't have any Licence

© holding Driving Licence, Enter DL Number DRIVING LICENCE NUMBER =
oo submi ¢t dc DT =

© holding Learner's Licence, Enter LL Number LEARNER'S LICENCE NUMBER aﬁ

Refresh
Note:If the Licence number contains space, please enter space

Example1:if the LL No: RJ14 /0001234/2017 enter LL number as RJ14<Space>/0001234/2017
Example2:If the DL No: MHO1 20170001234 enter DL number as MHO1<Space>20170001234




oaTaT]']'i w m m m m HIE SR DATE: 10-11-2017 10:48:30 AM
MINISTRY OF ROAD TRANSPORT & HIGHWAYS SEARCH engisn -]
Government of India

Select State and RTO office from where LL is being applied

* State Chhattisgarh B * RTO Office DTO.DHAMTARI — CG05 B Pincode PINCODE
Personal Details
* Name of the Applicant MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT
12
* Relation Father B GAUTAM SINGH RAJPUT

Aadhaar Number AADHAAR NUMBER NPR Number NPR NUMBER
* Full Name as per Records MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT

25-05-1988 Age 29 ¥rs

INDIA B

* Gender  @Male ©Female C'Trans Gender

Place of Birth RAIPUR * Country of Bil

* Qualification Post Graduate in Nor El Blood Group
Phone Number EX:04023659856 Email Id
* Mobile Number +91 8982736613 Emergency Mobile
Number
Identification Marks 1 MOLE IN CHEST 2, IDENTIFICATION MARKS
Address
* Present Address (To be Printzd on SmartCard) * Permanent Address
- State Chhattisgarh B Copy to Permanent Address
e * State Chhattisgarh E|
* District Dhamtari B
* District Dhamtari El
* Tahsil Dhamtari B
* Tahsil Dhamtari El
@Village @ Town Barna
i Barna El
Address Line1 HOUSE/DOORIFLAT NO Pvillage ©Town
Address Line1 HOUSE/DOOR/FLAT NO
Line 2 BARNA
Line 2 BARNA
*Line 3 DHAMTARI.CG
*Line 3 DHAMTARI.CG
* Pincode 493773
R Pincede 493773
Duration of stay at Present Address YEARS Years | MONTH Months
Select Class of Vehicles LL Details DL Details Biometrics
Press and Hold Ctrl key to Select multiple Covs Selected Covs
Motor cycle without Gear (Non Transport) (MCWOG) P = LMV-NT (LMV)
LMV -3 Wheeler NT (3W-NT) «« [ ﬂ Motor Cycle with Gear(Non Transport) (MCWG)
LMV-Tractor-NT (TRCTOR)
Invalid Carriage Vehicle (INVCRG) < -
I have been Ci i i ifi Licence was C. imy Licence was revoked ? [[] (Please Tick if Yes)

Is the applicant trained from Driving School ? [[] (Please Tick if Yes)

Declaration

1.1 am willing to donate my ergans, in case of accidental death? [] (Please Tick if willing)
2.1 here by declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the particulars given above are true YES [7] NO

Designed, developed and hosted by

National Informatic: ntre
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Search

Carafhi .

i Applicant RTO Location :
Application No : 2288617 Name : MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT Address -
Application Date : 10-11-2017 Dale-oiBirth : 25-05-1988 . DTO,DHAMTARI
Blood Group : Unknown Father Name ~GAUTAM SINGH RAJPUT Bamna COLLECTORATE
Applicant Gender : Male Dhamtari,CG OFFICE
Pincode : 493773 DHAMTARI
Services Requested Documentary Froof Required DHAMTARI.C.G.

07722-238006

Address Proof
Physical fitness (Form 1)
Age Proof

1. Issue of New LL Application ( LMV, MCWG )

application HeR
ie @Y next qe4

foa® F3 M

IR0 A
2288817

" Your application is submitted for processing and quole this Application Number: 2288617 for all future reference .

" An SMS has been sent to your mobile ****6613 .

For any reference visit: hitps.//parivahan.gov.in/sarathiservice

Designed, developed and hos
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English

Search

= Application Number : 2288617 = Date of Birth : 25.05-1088 If Application is submitted at other Portals likes
(sarathi.nic.in.e-Mitra,Camp.etc.)
Applicant Details
Appl No.: 2288617 Appl Date:  10-11-2017 RTO Name: DTO,DHAMTARI Print Acknowledgement
Print Form1
Name: MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT DOB: 25-05-1988 Father's Name: GAUTAM SINGH RAJPUT print Form1-A

Requested Details

“ Transactions Applied Class of vehicles Reference Licence Number
1 -

ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE MCWG LMV

Stage(s) to be completed

document upload

1. FILL APPLICATION DETAILS LL Completed .
Oupl QAD DOCIUMENT: Pending %@ W ﬁ
© 3. LLSLOT BOOK Pending
© 4. FEE PAYMENT Pending

click on otherwise click on m

If the latest status of application is not reflected then please click here

Completed Flow Details By Applicant
T T S N

ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE FILL APPLICATION DETAILS LL Completed 10-11-2017
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE UPLOAD DOCUMENTS Pending
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE LL SLOTBOOK Pending
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE FEE PAYMENT Pending

ned, developed and hosted by

National Infermatic:
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Upload Documei
* Application Number 2201117 * Date of Birth 01-09-1988
Applicant Info
Application Number 2291117 Application Date 13-11-2017
Name MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT [ — FATHER
Transactions applied 1ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE(MCWG) m Reference Licence details

2 ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE(LMV)

All Documents are Uploaded Successfully

Uploaded Documents

mm Froots ‘ b ‘ S m
1

Age Proof School/Educational Certificate 1 EDUCATION BOARD 26-07-1988 Saved Q

2 Address Proof Voter ID 1 ELECTION COM 02-11-1988  Saved &

3 Physical fitness (Form 1) ertificate-Form1 (Self Decleration) 3 DOCTOR 01-11-2017 Saved 0

* indicates andatory Document upload & 91

next g¢-1 31 faddd B3
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Application Status

* Application Number : 2288617 = Date of Birth - 25-05-1088 If Application is submitted at other Portals likes

sarathi.nic.in.e-Mitra.Camp.etc.

Appl No.: 2288617 Appl Date:  10-11-2017 RTO Name: DTO,DHAMTARI

Applicant Details

document upload
& §1G next

T

1 ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE

Name: MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT DOB: 25-05-1988 Father's Name: GAUTAM SINGH RAJPUT

Class of vehicles Reference Licence

MCW!

Stage(s) to be completed

1. FILL APPLICATION DETAILS LL Completed

2. UPLOAD DOCUMENTS Completed

Pending

© 4. FEE PAYMENT Pending

click on otherwise click on m

If the latest status of application is not reflected then please click here

Completed Flow Details By Applicant
I T S N S TR

ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE FILL APPLICATION DETAILS LL Completed 10-11-2017
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE UPLOAD DOCUMENTS Completed 10-11-2017
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE LL SLOT BOOK Pending
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE FEE PAYMENT Pending

Designed, developed and hos

National Informatic:
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Home Slot Booking ~ Slots Enquiry ~ Slots Cancellation ~ Help Log

SarathiOnWeb  Common Portal

LL TESTAPPOINTMENT
Slot Booking

Application No 2288617 Application Date 10/11/2017 10:48:56 AM Applicant Name MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT

Date of Birth 25-05-1988 Mobile no. 8982736613 RTO DTO,DHAMTARI

Calendar Available Quota
Calendar Indicator Slots Available. Click on preferable date to Book the Slot Select the Time and Click on BOOKSLOT Bution
@ siots Available Available Time Siots  10-11-2017

NO Siots Available € Prev November 2017 Next ¥

Holid Time Slots Available Seats
e R —
Previous/Future

10.30AM-11.30AM

ENENENKNEN - -
12 13 14

15 16 17 18 12.30PM-13.30PM

19 20 21 22 23 24 25
14 00PM-15.00PM

26 27 28 29 30

15.00PM-16.00PM @10
16.00PM-17.00PM ©10
17.00PN-18.00PM ©10

Designed, developed and hos

National Informatic:
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* Application Number : 2288617 = Date of Birth 25-05-1088 If Application is submitted at other Portals likes

sarathi.nic.in.e-Mitra.Camp.etc.

Appl No.. 2288617 Appl Date:  10-11-2017 RTO Name: DTO,DHAMTARI

Applicant Details
Print Acknowledgement

Print Form1

Name: MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT DOB:  25-05-1988 Father's Name: GAUTAM SINGH RAJPUT Print Formi-A
Print LL Slot Acknowledgement

Requested Details

“ Transactions Applied Class of vehicles Reference Licence Number

ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE MCWG LMV

Stage(s) to be completed

. FILL APPLICATION DETAILS LL Completed

]

UPLOAD DOCUMENTS Completed

LL 10T BooK completed fees payment & fefC
. FEEAPAYMENT Bonding dcH W ﬁ

K«
click on otherwise click on m

If the latest status of application is not reflected then please click here

Completed Flow Details By Applicant
I T S N S TR

@

@
IS

ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE FILL APPLICATION DETAILS LL Completed 10-11-2017
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE UPLOAD DOCUMENTS Completed 10-11-2017
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE LL SLOT BOOK Completed 10-11-2017
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE FEE PAYMENT Pending

LL Test Slot Details

“ Test Slot Date Test Slot Time Slot Booked Date

10-11-2017 10.30AM-11.30AM 10-11-2017
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Enter Details

= Application No: 2288617 = Date of Birth : 25-05-1988

* represents User Input Fields

Transaction Details

Applicant Name: RTO: State:
MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT DTO.DHAMTARI Chhattisgarh
LLTEST 50.00 0.00 §0.00
Grand Total 350.00 EI
Total Amount to be Paid (I): 350.00 Three Hundred Fifty Rupees Only

Payment Options

© Bank / Gateway / Tresury: STATE BANK OF HYDERABA

Mail will be sent to this id: SMS will be sent to this Phone No:

Disclaimer: The details shown are for informational purposes only. They are based on the information received from the Department. NIC does not hold any responsibility for the contents.

Designed, developed and h
National Informatics C:

%) PARIVAHAN Rarra) m m m m HRE TR DATE: 10-11-2017 11:06:53 AM

SEWA MINISTRY OF ROAD TRANSPORT & HIGHWAYS Search Engisn  []
Government of India

EMENT

Payment received successfully following are the Details

Receipt No TR/4691
Application Number 2288617 :‘
Applicant Name MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT rece'pt prlnt
Rto Name DTO,DHAMTARI
Sarathi Transaction id CG2017GA0000590
Bank Name STATE BANK OF HYDERABAD
Bank Ref.No

EPCG2017GA0000590

Amount(?)

Payment Date

Print Receipt

Disclaimer: The details shown are for informational purposes only. They are based on the information received from the Department. NIC does not hold any responsibility for the contents.

ned, developed and hosted by
Vational Informatics Centre
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Ap| n Status

* Application Number : 2288617 = Date of Birth - 25-05-1088 If Application is submitted at other Portals likes

sarathi.nic.in.e-Mitra.Camp.etc.

Appl No.: 2288617 Appl Date:  10-11-2017 RTO Name: DTO,DHAMTARI

Applicant Details

Print Acknowledgement
Print Form1

Print ForfM-A

Print LL Slot Ackngwledgement

Name: MOHIT SINGH RAJPUT DOB: 25-05-1988 Father's Name: GAUTAM SINGH RAJPUT

Requested Details

I T S T |
wid print B

ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE MCWG LMV

If the latest status of application is not reflected then please

Completed Flow Details By Applicant
T S NN T

ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE FILL APPLICATION DETAILS LL Completed 10-11-2017
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE UPLOAD DOCUMENTS Completed 10-11-2017
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE LL SLOTBOOK Completed 10-11-2017
ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE FEE PAYMENT Completed 10-11-2017

Current Status

Application is under processing at RTO Level.

ISSUE OF LEARNERS LICENCE SCRUTINY RTOAUTH4

LL Test Slot Details

“ Test Slot Date Test Slot Time Slot Booked Date

10-11-2017 10.30AM-11.30AM 10-11-2017

m NATIONAL
INFORMATICS
CENTRE




"FORM 2 Appl MO, mesn T Det0-11-2017
[See rule 10]
FORM OF APPLICATION FOR THE GRANT OF LEARNER'S LICENCE
To
The Licensing Autrty,
DT, DHAMT AR

| here by apoly for a licence authorsing me b dive 35 3 leamer, the Talowing motor vechice(s |-
MOWG, LA
PARTICULARS T BE FURMISHED BY APPLICANT

1. Full Hame MOHIT SINGH RAFUT

2 Faiter's Name GALTAM SINGH RAFUT
3 FPemnanant sodress :
{Blectoral Fiod | Life Insurance Foicy | Fassport | Pay Slip lssusd by amy Eama
office of the Ceniral Sovemmens | Siabe Govemment of 3 kocal body | D 25
Any other documents as may be presoibed by the Sabe Govemment ¢ AEITTH
Afficaw savom batone an sYecutve magisirate or 3 First Class Judiclsl
Magistrate ora Notary Public i be snciosad).

4 Temporary sddress | Ofcal address, I &y ' Bara

Dhamian o0
£53773

5. Duralion of skay at the present address

6. Dabe of birth
{Eirth pertfficate | school cerificate ! affidavit swom befor= an
Ewecufive Magisirabe or a First Class Judichal Magisirais ora
Botary pubdc to be endosed).

7. Pace of 6irn

11

1z

. [ piace of birth out side indla when migrated fo India

Education CuaMcafion

. Idenification Mark(s)

Declarbon of cizenship status
) ¥ dmemed Citizen or Citizen by Sirth

(Bt cartficate and school certfab)

(In Support of Czen ship s Indan iobe sncosed)
{1} i Cittzmnship: b= acquinesd by Descant / Registration

(In case Ciizanship acquied by Descant, Sirth Cartfcats,

land / property docament of parent / In case of Cltizenship acquired

by regisiration cestficabe fo be enclossd]
§I) I CRzenship by NaturalizaSon

[Cestficabe of Mahsralzation and

Certficale of Registration o be endosed)
W} Fron-indian Clizen

['+'alld passport or other trave] documents. and Such other document or

Eiood Group
RH{RNesLS ) tactor

Post Gradusie in Mon Medcal Sdences
1 MOLE N CHEET

INDAA,



